

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Pest Control and  
 FOR: Extermination Services  
 TIME & (January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 25, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	American Eagle Enterprises LLC dba Pestmaster Services of SA TX 5710 West Interstate 10 San Antonio, TX 78201	Orkin, LLC 2800 NE Loop 410 #107 San Antonio, TX 78212	Pied Piper Pest Control, LLC 12103 Jones Mallsberger San Antonio, TX 78247	Worldwide Pest Control, Inc. 5808 IH 10 West San Antonio, TX 78201	Ecolab Inc. dba Ecolab Pest Elimination
1.	12 ea. Stephen M. Clouse WRC	PRICE TOTAL	250.00 3,000.00	250.00 3,000.00	536.25 6,435.00	480.00 5,760.00	NO BID
2.	12 ea. Environmental Services Lab	PRICE TOTAL	104.17 1,250.04	60.00 720.00	59.58 714.96	45.00 540.00	
3.	2 ea. Environmental Services Lab Cricket Treatment	PRICE TOTAL	125.00 250.00	40.00 80.00	40.00 80.00	80.00 160.00	
4.	12 ea. Bldg. 19 Fleet Maintenance Garage	PRICE TOTAL	41.67 500.04	55.00 660.00	32.50 390.00	40.00 480.00	
5.	12 ea. Eastside Service Center	PRICE TOTAL	135.42 1,625.04	170.00 2,040.00	178.00 2,136.00	160.00 1,920.00	
6.	2 ea. Eastside Service Center Cricket Treatment	PRICE TOTAL	125.00 250.00	150.00 300.00	60.00 120.00	80.00 160.00	
7.	12 ea. Heating & Cooling Plant - Alamodome	PRICE TOTAL	104.17 1,250.04	40.00 480.00	50.00 600.00	60.00 720.00	
8.	12 ea. Convention Center De-Chlorination Building	PRICE TOTAL	41.67 500.04	55.00 660.00	22.00 264.00	30.00 360.00	
9.	12 ea. Heating & Cooling Plant - Port San Antonio	PRICE TOTAL	145.83 1,749.96	65.00 780.00	110.00 1,320.00	100.00 1,200.00	
10.	12 ea. Heating & Cooling Plant - Commerce	PRICE TOTAL	104.17 1,250.04	95.00 1,140.00	95.00 1,140.00	85.00 1,020.00	
11.	2 ea. Heating & Cooling Plant - Commerce Cricket Treatment	PRICE TOTAL	125.00 250.00	75.00 150.00	40.00 80.00	80.00 160.00	
12.	6 ea Helotes Pump Station	PRICE TOTAL	41.67 250.02	25.00 150.00	22.00 132.00	30.00 180.00	
13.	6 ea Josephine SCADA Building	PRICE TOTAL	41.67 250.02	25.00 150.00	22.00 132.00	20.00 120.00	
14.	12 ea. Leon Creek Treatment Plant	PRICE TOTAL	145.83 1,749.96	75.00 900.00	180.00 2,160.00	150.00 1,800.00	

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
**P. O. BOX 2449**  
**SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449**  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Pest Control and  
 FOR: Extermination Services  
 TIME & DATE: (January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020)  
 3:00 p.m., November 25, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		American Eagle Enterprises LLC dba Pestmaster Services of SA TX 5710 West Interstate 10 San Antonio, TX 78201	Orkin, LLC 2800 NE Loop 410 #107 San Antonio, TX 78212	Pied Piper Pest Control, LLC 12103 Jones Malsberger San Antonio, TX 78247	Worldwide Pest Control, Inc. 5808 IH 10 West San Antonio, TX 78201	Ecolab Inc. dba Ecolab Pest Elimination
15.	12 ea. Lone Oak Service Center		0.00	0.00	0.00	30.00 360.00	NO BID
16.	12 ea. Medio Creek Treatment Plant	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	187.50 2,250.00	75.00 900.00	130.00 1,560.00	120.00 1,440.00	
17.	12 ea. Mission Service Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	62.50 750.00	80.00 960.00	55.00 660.00	50.00 600.00	
18.	12 ea. Northeast Service Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	72.92 875.04	50.00 600.00	65.00 780.00	60.00 720.00	
19.	2 ea. Northeast Service Center Cricket Treatment	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 250.00	75.00 150.00	40.00 80.00	80.00 160.00	
20.	12 ea. Northwest Service Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 1,125.00	60.00 720.00	65.00 780.00	60.00 720.00	
21.	2 ea. Northwest Service Center Cricket Treatment	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 250.00	75.00 150.00	40.00 80.00	80.00 160.00	
22.	12 ea. Mission Field Division	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 1,125.00	40.00 480.00	40.00 480.00	40.00 480.00	
23.	6 ea. Salado Creek Treatment Plant	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 562.50	125.00 750.00	40.00 240.00	120.00 720.00	
24.	12 ea. Twin Oaks ASR Plant	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 1,500.00	65.00 780.00	85.00 1,020.00	90.00 1,080.00	
25.	12 ea. Van Dyke Service Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 1,125.00	65.00 780.00	65.00 780.00	60.00 720.00	
26.	6 ea. Mitchell Lake Audubon Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 562.50	55.00 330.00	60.00 360.00	60.00 360.00	
27.	6 ea. Hildebrand Tank Site and Control Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	52.08 312.48	40.00 240.00	30.00 180.00	35.00 210.00	
28.	12 ea. SAWS Headquarters	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	375.00 4,500.00	250.00 3,000.00	300.00 3,600.00	275.00 3,300.00	

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
**P. O. BOX 2449**  
**SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449**  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Pest Control and  
 FOR: Extermination Services  
 TIME & DATE: (January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020)  
 3:00 p.m., November 25, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	American Eagle Enterprises LLC dba Pestmaster Services of SA TX 5710 West Interstate 10 San Antonio, TX 78201	Orkin, LLC 2800 NE Loop 410 #107 San Antonio, TX 78212	Pied Piper Pest Control, LLC 12103 Jones Malsberger San Antonio, TX 78247	Worldwide Pest Control, Inc. 5808 IH 10 West San Antonio, TX 78201	Ecolab Inc. dba Ecolab Pest Elimination
29.	6 ea. Median Surface Water Treatment Plant	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	31.25 187.50	50.00 300.00	50.00 300.00	55.00 330.00	NO BID
30.	20 ea. Special Trapping @ Headquarters including set up and two trips. On Request Only	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	20.00 400.00	125.00 2,500.00	50.00 1,000.00	135.00 2,700.00	
31.	40 ea. Additional Trip Charges for Special Trapping	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	25.00 1,000.00	30.00 1,200.00	40.00 1,600.00	45.00 1,800.00	
32.	15 ea. Rodent Extermination at non baited locations to include two return trips. On Request Only	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 1,875.00	75.00 1,125.00	65.00 975.00	135.00 2,025.00	
33.	30 ea. Additional Trip Charges for Rodent Extermination	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	50.00 1,500.00	25.00 750.00	20.00 600.00	45.00 1,350.00	
34.	14 ea. Dos Rios Drying Beds On Request Only	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	75.00 1,050.00	275.00 3,850.00	275.00 3,850.00	300.00 4,200.00	
35.	50 ea. Hourly rate for other spraying per Special Request for Seasonal Invaders	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	65.00 3,250.00	70.00 3,500.00	45.00 2,250.00	45.00 2,250.00	
36.	500 ea. Bee, ant, and snake extermination/removal On Request Only	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	10.00 5,000.00	25.00 12,500.00	25.00 12,500.00	25.00 12,500.00	
37.	25 ea. Additional Rodent Bait Boxes	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	16.50 412.50	13.00 325.00	16.00 400.00	25.00 625.00	
38.	25 ea. Instllation and initial baiting of rodent boxes	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	25.00 625.00	5.00 125.00	5.00 125.00	5.00 125.00	
39.	1 ea. Trap pigeon live capture	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	50.00 50.00	75.00 75.00	95.00 95.00	55.00 55.00	
40.	1 ea. Initial installation/baiting; Include removal of existing nest	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	35.00 35.00	75.00 75.00	145.00 145.00	85.00 85.00	
41.	1 ea. Wkly check/re-baiting Traps TRAPS (Pigeon)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	35.00 35.00	75.00 75.00	65.00 65.00	135.00 135.00	

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for Pest Control and  
 FOR: Extermination Services  
 TIME & DATE: (January 1, 2020 through December 31, 2020)  
 3:00 p.m., November 25, 2019

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	American Eagle Enterprises LLC dba Pestmaster Services of SA TX 5710 West Interstate 10 San Antonio, TX 78201	Orkin, LLC 2800 NE Loop 410 #107 San Antonio, TX 78212	Pied Piper Pest Control, LLC 12103 Jones Mallsberger San Antonio, TX 78247	Worldwide Pest Control, Inc. 5808 IH 10 West San Antonio, TX 78201	Ecolab Inc. dba Ecolab Pest Elimination
42.	1 ea. Additional Trip Charges for (Pigeon)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	35.00 35.00	50.00 50.00	65.00 65.00	55.00 55.00	<b>NO BID</b>
43.	12 ea. Westside Operations Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 1,500.00	75.00 900.00	55.00 660.00	90.00 1,080.00	
44.	12 ea. Northside Operations Center	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	125.00 1,500.00	75.00 900.00	55.00 660.00	80.00 960.00	
45.	12 ea. Twin Oaks ASR Desal Plant	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 1,125.00	75.00 900.00	50.00 600.00	140.00 1,680.00	
46.	6 ea. Basin Station (MCC)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	93.75 562.50	75.00 450.00	40.00 240.00	60.00 360.00	
	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>	TOTAL	<b>49,455.22</b>	50,650.00	52,433.96	57,565.00	
	<b>EXTENSION 1</b>		<b>49,455.22</b>				
	<b>EXTENSION 2</b>		<b>49,455.22</b>				
	<b>EXTENSION 3</b>		<b>49,455.22</b>				
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	
	Delivery						

**\*LOW BIDDER**

**BIDS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:**

All American Pest Control  
 American Eagle Enterprises  
 A-Pest  
 DOA Pest Control  
 Ecolab Inc.  
 Jenkin Pest  
 Lonestar Pest Solution  
 Orkin

Pied Piper Pest Control  
 Right of Ways Pest Control  
 SA Bugs  
 Thomas Systems  
 Witten Pest  
 Worldwide Pest Control

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website